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Message 

From: 

Sent: 

To: 

CC: 

Subject: 

William R. Scherer, Ill [/O=CONRADSCHERER/OU=EXCHANGE ADMINISTRATIVE GROUP 

(FYDI BOHF23SPDL T)/CN=RECI Pl ENTS/CN=BS] 

5/11/2012 7:32:21 PM 

Richard Drath [/O=CONRADSCHERER/OU=EXCHANGE ADMINISTRATIVE GROUP 

(FYDI BOH F 23SPDL T)/CN =RECI Pl ENTS/CN =Richard Drath] 

lee bialostok [lee@plattelaw.com] 

RE: Details on funds 

Terry paid .$10K to Ivan Otero and is asking for reimbursement? Who is Ivan Otero? 

From: Richard Drath 
Sent: Friday, May 11, 2012 3:28 PM 
To: William R. Scherer, III 
Cc: lee bialostok 
Subject: Fw: Details on funds 

fyi 

richard drath 

633 s. federal highway 

suite 800 

ft. lauderdale, fl 33301 

954-847-3340 - office 

954-770-7009 - cell 

954-252-3810 - fax 

rdrath11@yahoo.com 

----- Forwarded Message-----
From: Terrence Collingsworth <TC@conradscherer.com> 

To: Catherine H. Salomon <CSalomon@conradscherer.com> 

Cc: Richard Drath <rdrath11@yahoo.com> 

Sent: Friday, May 11, 2012 2:25 PM 

Subject: Details on funds 

The 10 k is for unusual costs for lawyers and prison guards and other people that successfully facilitated getting all of the 

AUC witnesses transferred from their prisons to the appropriate courts where we took their testimony. These are the 

sorts of costs we have discussed several times. I'm going back to Colombia Monday May 14- may 26 to finish the 

remaining testimonies and will certainly incur additional costs this nature of 3-4,000. 
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RICHARD, please advise on the outstanding 100k owed back to me as costs for Andre and company. I've sent the 

documentation twice now. Thanks 

I will work with Bill to schedule a summit for when I get back from Colombia. We need to get more help and move into 

full trial prep mode for Drummond. 

Terry Collingsworth 

Office Direct 202-543-5811 

Cell 202-255-2198 

On May 10, 2012, at 12:33 PM, "Catherine H. Salomon" 

<CSalomon@conradscherer.com<mailto:CSalomon@conradscherer.com» wrote: 

Hi Terry, 

Richard has requested that you provide us with additional information for your reimbursement of $10,000.00 for funds 

given to Ivan Otero 

Thank you, 

Catherine Salomon, Controller 

Conrad & Scherer, LLP 

633 south federal highway 

2nd Floor 

Ft. Lauderdale, Fl. 33301 

WORK PRODUCT 

954.847.3383 

csalomon@conradscherer.com<mailto:csalomon@conradscherer.com> 
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