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Ty Allmandinger

From: Terrence Collingsworth

Sent: Tuesday, January 24, 2012 12:34 PM

To: Ty Allmandinger

Cc: Maggie C. Crosby

Subject: TC please "reply all" with approval of D.C. admin request 01.17.12
OK TO PAY!

From: Ty Allmandinger

Sent: Tuesday, January 24, 2012 12:20 PM

To: Maggie C. Crosby

Subject: RE: TC please "reply all" with approval of D.C. admin request 01.17.12

Hi Maggie,

Terry never approved these, do you think you could send out a repeat email asking for it? Gracias!

From: Maggie C. Crosby

Sent: Tuesday, January 17, 2012 10:30 AM

To: Catherine H. Salomon; Ty Allmandinger

Subject: TC please "reply all* with approval of D.C. admin request 01.17.12

Good morning!

Terry, please "reply all* with your approval of this week's admin requests.

Ty and Cathy, please see attached and process for payment.

- Maggie Crosby reimbursement: matter num bers vary, please see attached sheet.

- Victoria Ryan: timesheet for contract hours worked on matter 090501.

Thanks!

*Note

Since the procedure has changed and you are now sending the money to IRAdvocates and asking me o make the
moneygram/westarn union transactions, we'll need to process requests even further in advance. Please make sure that
this money gets transferred to the IRAdvocates account by Wednesday, February 1st, so that | have an extra day for

these wire errands.

**plaase alsa include $40 for Yina wire and $25 for Jose wire with these requests, as | need to pay processing fees.
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Monthly Halcon Wire - please send $1,250 via Western Union to Jose Joaquin Pinzon Diaquiz {first name Jose Joaquin,

last name Pinzon Diaquiz) in Villavicencio, Colombia. Matter £90501.

on to Gilma Yineth Baeza Acosta (first name Gilma Yineth, last

Monthly Charris Wire please send $820 via Western Uni A
ponding people. This is for Drummond Rail,

name Baeza Acosta) in Bogota, Colombia, and she will get it to the corres
matter 090501.
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